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Catalog # A-31556

Goat anti-Rabbit IgG (H+L) Cross-Adsorbed Secondary Antibody, 
Alexa Fluor™ 405

Product Details

Size 1 mg

Species Reactivity Rabbit

Host/Isotype Goat / IgG

Class Polyclonal

Type Secondary Antibody

Conjugate Alexa Fluor™ 405

Excitation/Emission 
Max

401/422 nm

Immunogen Gamma Immunoglobins Heavy and Light chains

Form Liquid

Concentration 2 mg/mL

Purification purified

Storage buffer PBS, pH 7.5

Contains 5mM sodium azide

Storage conditions 4° C, store in dark

RRID AB_221605

Applications Tested Dilution Publications

Western Blot (WB) - 0 Publication

Immunohistochemistry (IHC) 1-10 µg/mL 0 Publication

Immunohistochemistry (Paraffin) (IHC (P)) - 0 Publication

Immunohistochemistry (PFA fixed) (IHC (PFA)) - 0 Publication

Immunohistochemistry (Frozen) (IHC (F)) - 0 Publication

Immunocytochemistry (ICC/IF) 1-10 µg/mL 0 Publication

Flow Cytometry (Flow) 1-10 µg/mL 0 Publication

Functional Assay (Functional) - 0 Publication

Miscellaneous PubMed (Misc) - 0 Publication

Product Specific Information

Product will be shipped at Room Temperature.
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Product Images For Goat anti-Rabbit IgG (H+L) Cross-Adsorbed Secondary Antibody, Alexa Fluor™ 405

Rabbit IgG (H+L) Cross-Adsorbed Secondary Antibody (A-31556) in ICC/IF
Immunofluorescence analysis of Goat anti-Rabbit IgG (H+L) Cross-Adsorbed 
Secondary Antibody, Alexa Fluor 405 (Product # A-31556) was performed using 
MCF 10A (positive model) and A-431 (negative model) cells stained with 
Vimentin Polyclonal Antibody (Product # PA5-27231). The cells were fixed with 
4% paraformaldehyde for 10 minutes, permeabilized with 0.1% Triton™ X-100 
for 10 minutes, blocked with 1% BSA for 1 hour and labeled with 2 µg/mL primary 
antibody for 3 hours at room temperature. Goat anti-Rabbit IgG (H+L) Cross-
Adsorbed Secondary Antibody, Alexa Fluor 405 (Product # A-31556) in 0.1% 
BSA in PBS for 45 minutes at room temperature, was used for detection of 
Vimentin in the cytoplasm (Panel a: blue). Nuclei (Panel b: red) were stained with 
SYTOX™ Orange Nucleic Acid Stain (Product # S11368). F-actin was stained 
with Alexa Fluor® 488 Phalloidin (Product # A12379, 1:300) (Panel c: green). 
Panel d represents the composite image. The specificity of the secondary 
antibody was proved by the absence of signal in A-431 (negative model for 
vimentin) due to no primary antibody binding (Panel e). Nonspecific staining was 
not observed with secondary antibody alone (panel f). The images were captured 
at 20X magnification.

Rabbit IgG (H+L) Cross-Adsorbed Secondary Antibody (A-31556) in ICC/IF
Inhibition of EMT and CSC markers in bone lesions following in vivo 
administration of anti-PTHrP mAb: IF staining and mRNA level for Slug in MDA-
MB-231 PthlhWT injected mice (A) and PT-TNBC PthlhWT injected mice (B). IF 
staining and mRNA level for ALDH1 in MDA-MB-231 PthlhWT injected mice (C) 
and PT-TNBC PthlhWT injected mice (D). IF staining and mRNA level for E-
cadherin in MDA-MB-231 PthlhWT injected mice (E) and PT-TNBC PthlhWT 
injected mice (F). IF staining and mRNA level for vimentin in MDA-MB-231 
PthlhWT injected mice (G) and PT-TNBC PthlhWT injected mice (H). Scale 
bar = 100 mm, n = 10, p < 0.001. (I) Diagram summarizing mechanistic 
involvement of PTHrP in EMT and CSC number control and therapeutic 
implications. In TNBC cells in vitro, Pthlh ablation inhibits vimentin, Slug, ALDH1, 
and CD49f, enhances E-cadherin and lowers CD44/CD24 ratio and 
mammosphere formation, while our anti-PTHrP mAb inhibits KI67 and cell 
survival and motility. In vivo, the mAb inhibits vimentin, Slug, and ALDH1 in 
TNBC xenografts and increases E-cadherin, leading to growth inhibition of 
established TNBC bone tumors. Image collected and cropped by CiteAb from the 
following publication (https://pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/35720668), licensed under 
a CC BY license.
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For Research Use Only. Not for use in diagnostic procedures. Not for resale without express authorization. Products are warranted to operate or perform substantially in conformance with published Product specifications in effect at the time of sale, as set forth in the Production documentation, 

specifications and/or accompanying package inserts ("Documentation"). No claim of suitability for use in applications regulated by FDA is made. The warranty provided herein is valid only when used by properly trained individuals. Unless otherwise stated in the Documentation, this warranty is 

limited to one year from date of shipment when the Product is subjected to normal, proper and intended usage. This warranty does not extend to anyone other than the Buyer. Any model or sample furnished to Buyer is merely illustrative of the general type and quality of goods and does not 

represent that any Product will conform to such model or sample. NO OTHER WARRANTIES, EXPRESS OR IMPLED, ARE GRANTED INCLUDING WITHOUT LIMITATION, IMPLIED WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, FITNESS FOR ANY PARTICULAR PURPOSE, OR NON INFRINGEMENT. 

BUYER'S EXCLUSIVE REMEDY FOR NON-CONFORMING PRODUCTS DURING THE WARRANTY PERIOD IS LIMITED TO REPAIR, REPLACEMENT OF OR REFUND FOR THE NON-CONFORMING PRODUCT(S) AT SELLER'S SOLE OPTION. THERE IS NO OBLIGATION TO REPAIR, REPLACE OR 

REFUND FOR PRODUCTS AS THE RESULT OF (I) ACCIDENT, DISASTER OR EVENT OF FORCE MAJEURE, (II) MISUSE, FAULT OR NEGLIGENCE OF OR BY BUYER, (III) USE OF THE PRODUCTS IN A MANNER FOR WHICH THEY WERE NOT DESIGNED, OR (IV) IMPROPER STORAGE AND 

HANDLING OF THE PRODUCTS. Unless otherwise expressly stated on the Product or in the documentation accompanying the Product, the Product is intended for research only and is not to be used for any other purpose, including without limitation, unauthorized commercial uses, in vitro 

diagnostic uses, ex vivo or in vivo therapeutic uses, or any type of consumption by or application to human or animals.


